CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS
ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

An ordinance adopting new editions of each section of International Building Codes
which sets the standards for building in the City of Owens Cross Roads

An ordinance of the City of Owens Cross Roads, Owens Cross Roads, Alabama adopting new
editions of the International Building Code, (IBC), regulating and governing the construction and
maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities,
facilities, and other physical things and conditions, essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary,
and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human
occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures in the City of Owens Cross Roads; providing for
the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; repealing Ordinance 87-5 of the City of Owens
Cross Roads and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

The City Council of the City of Owens Cross Roads ordains as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document which is on file in the office of the Clerk, keeper of the records, for the
City of Owens Cross Roads, being marked and designated as the following:

e International Building Code, 2018 Edition

e International Residential Code, 2018 Edition

e International Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition

e International Mechanical Code, 2018 Edition

e International Fuel Gas Code, 2018 Edition

e International Swimming Pool & Spa Code, 2018 Edition

o International Fire Code, 2018 Edition

e Existing Building Code, 2018 Edition

e International Energy Conservation Code, 2015 Edition (As mandated and amended by the State of
Alabama)

e National Electrical Code, 2017 Edition

including Appendix Chapters as published by the International Code Council, be hereby adopted as the
Building Code of the City of Owens Cross Roads, in the State of Alabama for regulating and governing the
construction and maintenance of all property, to insure that buildings and structures are safe, sanitary
and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human
occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of
permits and collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties,
conditions and terms of said Building Code on file in the office of the City of Owens Cross Roads are hereby
referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as fully set out in this ordinance with the additions, insertions,
deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in the following sections of this ordinance.

OWENS CROSS ROADS CITY COUNCIL
_ ORDINANCE NO. 22-016
ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODES



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

The following sections of the IBC 2018 Edition are hereby revised:
SECTION 2. International Residential Code Adopted.

The International Residential Code, 2018 edition, save and except Section R313 (Automatic Fire Sprinkler
Systems) and Appendix Chapters "F", "I" and "K" "(hereinafter referred to as the "International
Residential Code"), published by the International Code Council, 5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls
Church, Virginia 22041-3401, the Building Officials and Code Administrators International, Inc., 4051
West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795, the International Conference of Building
Officials, 5360 Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California 90601-2298, and the Southern Building Code
Congress International, Inc., 900 Montclair Road, Birmingham, Alabama 35213-1206, is adopted by
reference and made a part of this chapter as if fully set out, save and except such parts or portions thereof
as are specifically deleted, added or changed in Article I, Sections 3 through and including 23. The subject
matter of the adopted code includes comprehensive provisions and standards regulating the construction,
alteration, moving, demolition, occupancy, use, height, area and maintenance of all residential buildings
or other structures within the City of Owens Cross Roads for the purpose of protecting the public health,
safety and general welfare.

SECTION 3. Marked Copies of Code on File.

There shall be at least one (1) copy of the code adopted kept on file in the office of the building official,
which shall be available for public inspection at Owens Cross Roads City Hall Building Department
between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, legal holidays excepted.

SECTION 4. Code Official.

The Building Inspector or his or her designee will be known as the code official or building official for the
purposes of this ordinance and will have the duty of enforcing provisions of this ordinance.

SECTION 5. Subsection R101.1 Amended - Title.

Subsection Rio1.1 of the International Residential Code entitled "Title" is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Subsection R101.1 Amended - Title. These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code of the City of
Owens Cross Roads, and shall be cited as such and will be referred to herein as "this code.”

SECTION 6. Subsection R101.2 Amended - Scope.

Subsection R101.2 of the International Residential Code entitled "Scope" is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Subsection R101.2 Amended - Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to the construction, alteration,
movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, removal and
demolition of detached one- and two-family dwellings and their accessory structures within the
incorporated area of the City of Owens Cross Roads. The provisions of this code shall not apply to the
following:

1. Improvements intended to be used for agricultural purposes unless any part of the building is to
be used for residential purposes.

2. Commercial buildings other than houses or multi-family housing units unless any part of the
building is to be used for residential purposes.

3. Existing buildings undergoing repair, alteration or addition and change of occupancy which may
be required to comply with the International Existing Building Code.



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

SECTION 7. Subsection R104.6 Amended - Right of entry.

Subsection R104.6 of the International Residential Code entitled "Right of entry" is hereby amended to
read as follows:

Subsection R104.6 Amended - Right of entry. Where it is necessary to make an inspection to enforce the
provisions of this code, or where the building official has reasonable cause to believe that there exists in a
structure or upon a premises a condition which is contrary to or in violation of this code which makes the
structure or premises unsafe, dangerous or hazardous, the building official or designee is authorized to
enter the structure or premises at reasonable times to inspect or to perform the duties imposed by this
code, provided that if such structure or premises be occupied that credentials be presented to the occupant
and entry requested. If such structure or premises be unoccupied, the building official shall first make a
reasonable effort to locate the owner or other person having charge or control of the structure or premises
and request entry. If entry is refused, the building official shall have recourse to the remedies provided by
law to secure entry.

R104.6.1 Repair of dangerous equipment. When any building or equipment is found by the building official
or his or her designee to be dangerous to persons or property because it is defective or defectively installed,
the person, firm or corporation responsible for the building or equipment shall be notified in writing and
shall make any changes or repairs required in the judgment of the building official or his or her designee
to place such equipment in safe condition, and if such work is not completed within fifteen (15) days, the
building official or his or her designee shall have the authority to disconnect or order the discontinuance
of electric, gas, or plumbing equipment. In cases of emergency, where necessary for safety to persons or
property, or where electrical, gas, or plumbing equipment may interfere with the work of a fire
department, the building official or his or her designee shall have the authority to immediately disconnect
or cause the disconnection of any electrical, gas, or plumbing equipment.

SECTION 8. Subsection R105.1 Amended - Required.

Subsection R105.1 of the International Residential Code entitled "Required” is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Subsection R105.1 Amended - Required. Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge,
alter, repair, move, demolish, or change the occupancy of a building or other residential structure, or to
erect, install, enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert or replace any electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing
system, the installation of which is regulated by this code, shall first make application to the building
official and obtain the required permits. Whenever the work being performed includes any construction,
alteration, addition, or modification to the plumbing drainage system, or requires disconnection of the
electrical system in any way whatsoever, any owner or authorized agent shall first make application to the
building official and obtain the required permit regardless of the reasonable cost of the material and labor
for such work.

Exceptions: No permit shall be issued where sanitary sewer service is not available to the house, multi-
family housing unit or other residential structure being constructed, erected, remodeled, or repaired
without the written approval of the City of Owens Cross Roads Building Inspector.

A permit shall not be issued to any person for the construction, erection, remodeling, or repair of any
house, residential structure or multi-family housing unit within the City of Owens Cross Roads except the
bona fide owner or occupant of the land on which the building is to be constructed, erected, remodeled, or
repaired, or to a duly licensed contractor. The building official may require such proof as may be necessary
to ensure that such building or other residential structure, upon completion, shall be used for the benefit
of the owner or occupant.



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

SECTION 9. Subsection R105.2 Amended- Work exempt from permit.

Subsection R105.2 of the International Residential Code entitled "Work exempt from permit” is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Subsection R105.2 Amended- Work exempt from permit. Permits shall not be required for the following.
Exemption from the permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any
work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances
of this jurisdiction.

Building:

1.

12.

13.

One-story detached accessory structures provided the floor area does not exceed 200 square feet
(18.58 meter squared) and does not contain electrical services. A garage, tool shed, or other similar
structure is expressly excluded from this exception.

Fences not over 7 feet (1829 mm) high.

Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the bottom of the
footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.

Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons (18927 L)
and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.

Sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade and not over
any basement or story below.

Painting, papering, floor covering, counter tops and similar finish work.

Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 24 inches (610 mm) deep.

Swings and other playground equipment accessory to a one or two-family dwelling.

Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more than 54 inches (1372
mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.

. Buildings constructed specifically for agricultural purposes as defined by 2018 IBC Appendix C, do

not require permits for vertical construction, unless owner requires electrical service.

. Decks not exceeding 200 square feet in area, that are not more than 30 inches above the grade at

any point, are not attached to a dwelling and do not serve the exit door required by 2018 IRC
Section R311.4
Where the valuation does not exceed $1,000, unless it is necessary to disconnect from the main
power source, the work involves a change in the sewer or septic system, or unless inspection is
necessary. In these listed situations, a permit will be required, in which case there shall be fees
incurred.
Those exceptions listed in Subsection R101.2(1-3), as amended.

a. Electrical:

Repairs and maintenance: A permit shall not be required for minor repair work, including
the replacement of lamps or the connection of approved portable electrical equipment to
approved permanently installed receptacles, or decorative lighting.

Subsection 105.2.1 - Emergency repairs Subsection Ri05.2.1 of the International
Residential Code. Where equipment replacements and repairs must be performed in an
emergency, the permit application shall be submitted within the next working business day
to the building official.

b. Gas:
1. Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying appliances.



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment or make such
equipment unsafe.

3. Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.

¢. Mechanical:

. Portable heating appliance.

. Portable ventilation appliances.

. Portable cooling unit.

Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling equipment regulated by
this code.

Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment or make such
equipment unsafe.

. Portable evaporative cooler.

7. Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.

PWON R~

o

o)

d. Plumbing:

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe; provided, however, that
if any concealed trap, drainpipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe becomes defective and
it becomes necessary to remove and replace the same with new material, such work
shall be considered as new work and a permit shall be obtained and inspection made as
provided in this code.

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures, and the
removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs do not involve or
require the replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures.

SECTION 10. Subsection R105.5 Amended- Expiration.

Subsection R105.5 of the International Residential Code entitled "Expiration” is hereby amended to read
as follows:

Subsection R105.5 Amended - Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work
authorized by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the work authorized by
such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of one (1) year after the time the work is commenced.
The building official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for periods not
more than go days each. The extension submitted to the building official shall be requested in writing and
justifiable cause demonstrated.

SECTION 11. Subsection R105.9 Penalty.

Section R105.9 entitled "Penalty” is hereby added to and supplements the International Residential Code
and shall read as follows:

Subsection R105.9 Penalty. If any person, firm or corporation commences work in or on a building, house,
multi-family housing unit, swimming pool, or other residential structure subject to these regulations
before obtaining the necessary permits from the City of Owens Cross Roads, the permit fees shall be
tripled.



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

SECTION 12. Subsection R106.1 Amended-Submittal documents.

Subsection R106.1 of the International Residential Code entitled "Submittal documents” is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Subsection R106.1 Amended - Submittal documents. Construction documents, special inspection and
structural observation programs, and other data shall be submitted in one or more sets with each
application for a permit. The construction documents shall be prepared by a registered design professional
where required by the statutes of the jurisdiction in which the project is to be constructed. Where special
conditions exist, the building official is authorized to require additional construction documents to be
prepared by a registered design professional. The building/trade plans and design calculations, including,
without limitation, mechanical, electrical, plumbing and gas plans and design calculations, for all
dwellings, other than detached one-family dwellings or detached accessory structures, submitted to the
building official shall be stamped and signed by a licensed design professional (i.e., a licensed architect,
engineer or other design professional, as applicable) of the state of Alabama.

SECTION 13. Subsection R109.1.2 Amended- Plumbing, mechanical, gas and electrical
systems inspection.

Subsection R109.1.2 of the International Residential Code entitled "Plumbing, mechanical, gas and
electrical systems inspection" is hereby amended to read as follows:

Subsection R109.1.2 Amended - Plumbing, mechanical, gas and electrical systems inspection. Rough
inspection of plumbing, mechanical, gas and electrical systems shall be made prior to covering or
concealment, before fixtures or appliances are set or installed, and prior to installation of insulation.

Exception: Ground-source heat pump loop systems tested in accordance with Section M2105.1 shall be
permitted to be backfilled prior to inspection.

R109.1.2 Inspection and approval of equipment. The building official shall not inspect or approve any
plumbing, electrical wiring, gas piping, or gas burning equipment in any building within the
unincorporated area of the City of Owens Cross Roads, unless such work is done by a person, firm or
corporation duly licensed under the laws of the State of Alabama or a person doing work on his own
property as provided for in the laws of the State of Alabama.

SECTION 14. Subsection R109.4 Amended- Approval required.

Subsection R109.4 of the International Residential Code entitled "Approval required” is hereby amended
to read as follows:

Subsection R109.4 Amended - Approval required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indicated in
each successive inspection without first obtaining the approval of the building official. The building official
upon notification, shall make the requested inspection within seventy-two (72) hours of the time such
notice is given, exclusive of Saturdays, Sundays, and legal holidays, unless prevented by an Act of God,
emergency or act of the person, firm or corporation making the installation; provided, however, that the
inspector shall make no inspection unless the person, firm, or corporation responsible for the work shall
provide the inspector with sufficient evidence that all permits for the building in which said installation
was made have been obtained and paid for in full. Any work that does not comply shall be corrected and
such work shall not be covered or concealed until authorized by the building official.

R109.4.1 Equipment hidden from view. When any part of the building, plumbing, gas, or electrical
equipment is to be hidden from view by the permanent placement of parts of the building, the person, firm
or corporation installing the equipment shall notify the building official and such equipment shall not be
concealed until it has been inspected and approved by the building official or until seventy-two (72) hours,
exclusive of Saturdays, Sundays, and holidays, shall have elapsed from the time of such notification;



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

provided that on large installations, where concealment of equipment proceeds continuously, the person,
firm or corporation installing the equipment shall give the building official due notice, and inspections
shall be made periodically during the progress of the work.

SECTION 15. Section R110 Amended- Certificate of Occupancy and Certificate of Approval.
Section R110 of the International Residential Code entitled "Certificate of Occupancy” is hereby amended
and shall read as follows:

R110.1 Amended - Use and occupancy. A building or structure shall not be used or occupied, and a change
of occupancy or change of use of a building or structure or portion thereof shall not be made, until the
building official has issued a certificate of occupancy therefore as provided herein. Issuance of a ceitificate
of occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a violation of the provisions of this code or of other
resolutions of the jurisdiction. Certificates presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the provisions
of this code or other resolutions of the jurisdiction shall not be valid.

Exception: Certificates of occupancy are not required for work exempt from permits under Section
R105.2.

R110.2 Amended - Change in use. Changes in the character or use of an existing structure shall not be
made except as specified in ICC 2018 International Residential Code Appendix J and 2018 Existing
Building Code as referenced in Chapter 34 of the International Building Code.

R110.3 Amended - Certificate issued. Where the building official inspects the building or structure and
finds no violations of the provisions of this code or other laws, and that any and all permits for the building
in which the work is being performed have been obtained and paid for, and that all contractor’s licenses
for said building have been obtained and paid for, the building official shall issue a certificate of occupancy,
a copy of which may be obtained upon request, and shall contain the following:

The building permit number.

The address of the structure.

The name and address of the owner, or the owner's authorized agent.

A description of that portion of the structure for which the certificate is issued.

A statement that the described portion of the structure has been inspected for compliance with the
requirements of this code.

6. The Building Inspector’s name.

CL S o

Exceptions: No certificate of occupancy shall be issued until all required inspections are received by the
building official. In addition, no certificate of occupancy shall be issued until the building official receives
either (1) all required septic tank approvals, or (2) official correspondence from the public or private sewer
authority or entity representing to the building official that it will service the applicable dwelling or

property.

R110.4 Connection to Installations. It shall be unlawful for any person to make any connection from a
supply of gas or electricity or to supply gas or electricity to any gas or electrical equipment for the
installation of which a permit is required, or which has been disconnected or ordered to be disconnected
by the building official, until approval has been issued by the building official, authorizing the connection
and use of such equipment.

R110.5 Amended- Temporary occupancy. In cases of exceptional hardship or in cases affecting public
health, safety or welfare resulting from any natural disaster, the building official is authorized to issue a
temporary certificate of occupancy before the completion of the entire work covered by the permit,
provided that such portion or portions shall be occupied safely. The building official shall set a time during
which the temporary certificate of occupancy is valid.



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

R110.6 Revocation. The building official shall, in writing, suspend or revoke a certificate of occupancy
issued under the provisions of this code wherever the certificate is issued in error, or on the basis of
incorrect information supplied, or where it is determined that the building or structure or portion thereof
is in violation of any ordinance or regulation or any of the provisions of this code.

SECTION 16. Section R113 Amended- Violations and Penalties.

Section R113 of the International Residential Code entitled "Violations" is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Section R113 Amended - Violations and Penalties. Any person, firm or corporation who shall violate any
provisions of this code, or fail to comply therewith, or with any of the requirements thereof, or who shall
erect, construct, alter, demolish, or move any structure, or who has erected, constructed, altered, moved,
or demolished a building or structure in violation of a detailed statement or drawing submitted and
approved hereunder, or shall fail to comply with an order made under the provisions of this code, shall be
deemed guilty of a Class C misdemeanor. Each person shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each
day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions of this code is committed or
continued.

SECTION 17. Section R115 Contractors.

Section R115 entitled "Contractors" is hereby added to and supplements the International Residential
Code and shall read as follows:

R115.1 License. It shall be the duty of every contractor to pay a privilege license to the City of Owens Cross
Roads as provided in Ordinance No. 21-035 (Privilege License Code) adopted by the City of Owens Cross
Roads on October 26, 2021, as last amended, and to register his name in a book provided for that purpose
with the building official, giving full name, residence, and place of business, and in case of removal from
one place to another in City of Owens Cross Roads, to have made corresponding changes in said register
accordingly. Every contractor shall be duly licensed as required by the laws of the State of Alabama.

Ri115.2 Insurance.

a) Any person engaged as a contractor shall be covered by a public liability insurance policy to include
the coverage known as manufacturers and contractor’s liability and products and completed
operations, issued by a solvent insurance company, licensed to do business in the State, which said
policy shall be subject to the following minimum limitations.

b) For every contractor said policy shall provide a minimum coverage for all damages arising out of
the bodily injury to any one person of Fifty Thousand Dollars ($50,000) and bodily injury in any
one accident with an aggregate amount of One Hundred Thousand Dollars ($100,000). Said policy
shall provide minimum coverage for all damages to the property of others of Fifty Thousand
Dollars ($50,000) arising out of any one accident with an aggregate amount of Fifty Thousand
Dollars ($50,000). The minimum coverage for one occurrence must be One Hundred Fifty
Thousand Dollars ($150,000). These limits apply to both public liability and completed operations.

c¢) Such policy shall include an endorsement acceptable to the Building Inspector providing for ten
(10) days prior written notification to the Building Inspector of a material change or cancellation
of such policy. A certificate of insurance signed by the authorized agent of said company shall be
filed with the Building Inspector and shall remain on file with him.

R115.3 Use of name by another contractor. No person, firm or corporation shall allow his name to be used,
directly or indirectly, by any other person engaged as a contractor or subcontractor for the purpose of
obtaining a permit or for construction of any work, unless such person, firm or corporation whose name
is to be used actually supervise such work.



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

R115.4 Removal of a contractor. An owner, occupant or holder of any building permit desiring to remove
any contractor, who shall be required to first obtain a permit to practice his or her particular trade by this
code or other state or local law, must furnish the building official a copy of the written notification to said
contractor that he or she has been relieved of his or her contract. The holder of the building permit must
sign the other required forms at the office of the building official in person or mail a notarized copy of the
required forms to the building official.

SECTION 18. Section R202 Amended- Definitions.

Section R202 of the International Residential Code entitled "Definitions" is hereby supplemented with the
following definitions, which shall be incorporated in this code in the proper alphabetical order, as follows:

CONTRACTOR. Any person, firm or corporation who contracts to do work for another, including
but not limited to, an electrical, gas, general, heating and air conditioning, plumbing or residential
contractor, as herein defined.

CONTRACTING. Any job or project in the City of Owens Cross Roads regularly or customarily
performed by any contractor, including, but not limited to, an electrical contractor, gas contractor,
general contractor, heating and air conditioning contractor, plumbing contractor or residential
contractor, as herein defined.

ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR. Any person, firm or corporation who, for a fixed price,
commission, fee or wage, is engaged in the business of installing electrical power or control
systems; maintaining, altering, or repairing any electrical wiring devices, equipment or any other
electrical apparatus.

GAS CONTRACTOR. Any person, firm, or corporation who, for a fixed price, commission, fee
or wage, is engaged in the business of installing and/or repairing gas pipes, gas furnaces, and gas
appliances.

GENERAL CONTRACTOR. Any person, firm or corporation who, for a fixed price, commission,
fee or wage, is engaged in the business of the construction, erection, alteration, repair, or
demolition of buildings or structures, or one who contracts for the completion of an entire project,
including purchasing materials, hiring and paying subcontractors, and coordinating all the work.

HEATING AND AIR CONDITIONING CONTRACTOR. Any person, firm or corporation
who, for a fixed price, commission, fee or wage, is engaged in the installation, service, or repair of
heating and/or cooling apparatus consisting of an air, heating, and/or cooling fixture from pipes,
plenums, or blowers including any accessory and equipment installed in connection therewith;
excluding, however, window units, automotive, or farm implement type heating and/or air
conditioning equipment.

JOURNEYMAN ELECTRICIAN. Any person who possesses the necessary qualifications,
training and technical knowledge to install electrical wiring, apparatus or equipment for lighting,
heating, power or controls, as covered by the terms and provisions of this code, must work under
a master or state certified electrical contractor, also he/she shall be capable of doing said work
according to plans and specifications furnished by him/her and in accordance with standard rules
and regulations governing such work.

MASTER ELECTRICIAN. A person who possesses the necessary qualifications, training and
technical knowledge to plan, lay out and supervise the installation of electrical wiring, apparatus
or equipment for lighting, heating, power or controls, and who possesses any of the following: (a)
has obtained four (4) years of practical experience as a journeyman electrician in charge of jobs;
(b) has a professional electrical engineering degree; or (c) has five (5) years’ experience in the
design and construction of electrical systems.



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

PLUMBING CONTRACTOR. Any person, firm, or corporation who, for a fixed price,
commission, fee or wage, is engaged m the business of plumbing, steam fitting, installing sewers,
excavating, or blasting for same.

RESIDENTIAL CONTRACTOR. Any person, firm, or corporation who, for a fixed price,
commission, fee or wage, is engaged in the business of the construction, erection, alteration, repair,
or demolition of buildings or structures.

SECTION 20. Table R301.2(1) of Section 301 of the International Residential Code entitled
"Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria" is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R301.2(1)
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA (excerpt)

ROOF BASIC [ SEISMIC SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM
SNOW ‘WIND DESIGN
LOAD SPEED CATEGORY
WEATHERING FRONT TERMITE WINTER ICE BARRIER
LINE DESIGN UNDERLAYMENT
DEPTH TEMP REQUIRED
10 ~ gomph | B Moderate 12" Very 16 No

*Table 301.2(1): 1 pound per square foot= 0.0479 kPa, 1 mile per hour = 0.447m/s
See R301.2(1) for additional design criteria.
SECTION 21. Subsection R323.2.1 Amended- Elevation requirements.

Subsection R323.2.1 of the International Residential Code entitled "Elevation requirements” is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Subsection R322.2.1 Amended- Elevation requirements.

1. Buildings and structures shall have the lowest floors elevated to one (1) foot above
the design elevation.

2. Inareas of shallow flooding (AO Zones), buildings and structures shall have the lowest
floor (including basement) elevated at least as high above the highest adjacent grade
of not less than the depth number specified in feet (mm) on the FIRM plus 1 foot, or
at least three (3) feet if a depth number is not specified.

3. Basement floors that are below grade on all sides shall be elevated to one (1) foot above
the design flood elevation.

Exception: Enclosed areas below the design flood elevation, including basements whose floors
are not below grade on all sides, shall meet the requirements of Section R323.2.2.

SECTION 22. Footings shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the provisions of
Section R403 or in accordance with American Concrete Institute (ACI) 332.

SECTION 23. Subsection P2603.6 Amended - Freezing. Subsection R2603.6 of the
International Residential Code entitled "Freezing" is hereby amended to read as follows:

Subsection P2603.6 Amended- Freezing. In localities having a winter design
temperature of 32°F (0°C) or lower as shown in Table R301.2(1) of this code, a water, soil
or waste pipe shall not be installed outside of a building, in exterior walls, in attics, or in
any other place subjected to freezing temperature unless adequate provision is made to



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

protect it from freezing by insulation or heat or both. Water service pipe shall be
installed not less than 12 inches (305 mm) deep or less than 6 inches (152 mm) below the
frost line.

SECTION 24. Subsection AE301.1 Amended - Initial installation. Subsection AE301.]
of the International Residential Code entitled "Initial installation" is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Subsection AE301.1 Amended- Initial installation. A manufactured home shall not be installed
on a foundation system, reinstalled, or altered without first obtaining a permit from the building
official. A separate permit shall be required for each manufactured home installation. When
approved by the building official, such permit may include accessory buildings and structures
and their building service equipment when the accessory buildings or structures will be
constructed in conjunction with the manufactured home installation.

AE301.1.1 Schedule of permit fees. Manufactured housing permit. For the inspection and
verification of setup, electrical connections, and connection to an approved septic tank, shall
require permits.

ARTICLE 11
ELECTRICAL LICENSE REQUIREMENT

SECTION 1. Declaration of Purpose. This article is enacted for the purpose of safeguarding
homeowners and other property owners and tenants against faulty, inadequate, inefficient, or unsafe
electrical installations and to protect the life, health and property of homeowners and other property
owners and tenants in the City of Owens Cross Roads. Electrical contracting is hereby declared to
affect the public interest, and this article shall be liberally construed to accomplish the foregoing
purpose.

SECTION 2. License Required and Exemptions. No person shall engage in the electrical
contracting business or perform work as a master or journeyman electrician unless such person shall
have a valid and current license from the State of Alabama or an equivalent license or certification
from an entity which has been approved by the building official; provided, however, the provisions of
this article shall not apply:

1. To the installation, construction or maintenance of power systems for the
generation and secondary distribution of electric current constructed under the provisions
of the national electrical safety code which regulates the safety requirements of utilities.

-3 To the installation, construction, maintenance or repair of telephone or signal
systems by or for public utilities or their corporate affiliates, when such work pertains to the
service furnished by such utilities.

3. To the owner of any premises or any employee of any such owner when
performing electrical work or installing, constructing, maintaining, altering or repairing
electrical wiring, equipment or apparatus on such premises; provided, however, the owner
or employee shall obtain the proper permits, including payment of the required fees, comply
with all building standards set forth in the building codes of the City of Owens Cross Roads;

4. To an employee of an electric utility when installing or repairing electric
appliances and equipment for a customer.

5. To any retail merchant, or its employees making the installation of or the
repair or maintenance on any appliance that the merchant has sold; or

6. To the installation, construction or maintenance of systems that operate on
twenty-five (25) volts or less; or

<. To any electrical contractor who holds a current license from another local
authority provided that the person shall have achieved a passing grade on an examination
administered by such other local authority and that such examination has been approved



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

by the board of examinations and appeals for construction industries. All other fees and
requirements required for the issuance of that license must be met. Further, this Article II,
Section 2, Subsection 7 shall be effective for the period of one (1) year from the effective date
of this code, and thereafter shall be repealed without further action.

The licensing requirement set forth herein is for the purpose of establishing that a
person engaged in the electrical contracting business or performing work as a master or
journeyman electrician meets certain minimum qualifications for such work. All persons
performing work under a license issued by the State of Alabama or an equivalent license or
certification from an entity which has been approved by the building official must abide by
all state and local laws and ordinances.

SECTION 3. Compliance Period for Residential Construction. Any person engaged in the
electrical contracting business or performing work as a master or journeyman electrician, who meets
each of the three (3) criteria below, shall have one (1) year from August 1, 2005 to comply with the
licensing requirements of this chapter.

The said person shall have:

1. previously obtained or pulled an electrical permit from the building
official of Madison County;
2. avalid Alabama business, vocation or occupation privilege license(s) as

of August 1, 2005, which shall remain valid and current thereafter
during the compliance period; and

3. a public liability insurance policy in full force and effect as of August 1,
2005, which remains in full force and effect thereafter during the compliance
period.

SECTION 4. Display of License.

Every person holding alicense issued by the State of Alabama or an equivalent license or certification
from an entity which has been approved by the building official shall display it in a conspicuous
manner at the person's principal place of business.

SECTION 5. Injunctive Power.

Electrical contracting is hereby declared to involve activities affecting the public interest and
involving the health and safety and welfare of the public. Such activities, when engaged in by a
person who is not licensed, are declared to be a public nuisance, harmful to the public health, safety,
and welfare. The building official or the district attorney for City of Owens Cross Roads may bring a
petition to restrain and enjoin such unlicensed practice in City of Owens Cross Roads. It shall not
be necessary to obtain the equitable relief provided herein to allege or prove that there is no
adequate remedy at law.

SECTION 6. Criminal Penalty for Violation.

It shall be unlawful for any person to violate any provision of this chapter regulating electrical
contracting and any person convicted of such violation shall be punished as prescribed for a Class B
misdemeanor.

MISCEL E

SECTION 1. City of Owens Cross Roads Flood Ordinance.

Nothing contained in the ORDINANCE ADOPTING BUILDING LAWS AND CODES FOR THE
CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS is intended to repeal any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or
phrase of the City of Owens Cross Roads Flood Ordinance. If this code is, for any reason, held to
conflict with the City of Owens Cross Roads Flood Ordinance, such decision shall not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this code or the City of Owens Cross Roads Flood Ordinance.



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

SECTION 2. Civil Actions.

Notwithstanding contrary provisions hereinabove, the decisions of the building official or the
decisions of the Board of Building Inspection Appeals reviewing the decision of the building official
shall be enforceable in the District Court of the City of Owens Cross Roads, Alabama, or any other
court of competent jurisdiction upon action brought by the county attorney, or such other legal
counsel authorized to maintain such action for enforcement of the provisions of this chapter. This
provision is not intended to and does not create a private right of action or authorize any person to
act as a private attorney general.

SECTION 3. Liability.

The purpose of the ORDINANCE ADOPTING BUILDING LAWS AND CODES FOR THE CITY OF
OWENS CROSS ROADS is to secure to the City of Owens Cross Roads, as a whole, the benefits of a
well-ordered county government, or to protect the health and secure the safety of occupants of
buildings or other residential structures, and not to protect the personal or property interests of
individuals. This code, the issuance of permits, review of applications, construction documents or
other supporting documents, and any inspections made by or on behalf of the City of Owens Cross
Roads are not intended to be an insurance policy by which the City of Owens Cross Roads guarantees
that each building or other residential structure is built in compliance with this code, nor do such
actions constitute in any way a representation, warranty, assurance or statement that this code or
other applicable enactments respecting safety have been complied with by the owner or authorized
agent. It shall be the full and sole responsibility of the owner or authorized agent to carry out the work,
in respect of which the permit was issued, in compliance with this code or other applicable laws or
enactment respecting safety. No person shall rely upon any permit as establishing compliance with
this code or assume or conclude that this code has been administered or enforced according to its
terms. The person to whom the building permit is issued and his or her authorized agent shall be
responsible for making such determination.

The building official, his or her officers, agents or employees act exclusively for the benefit of the
public. The provisions established in this code hereinabove shall not be construed as imposing upon
the City of Owens Cross Roads, its officers, agents or employees any liability or responsibility for
neglectful, careless, unskillful, negligent, wanton or defective inspection or approval of any
installation, building, application, construction documents or other residential structure governed by
this code, nor for neglectful, careless, unskillful, negligent or wanton failure to review, inspect or
approve any installation, building, application, construction documents or other residential structure
governed by this code. The City of Owens Cross Roads shall not be liable or responsible for damages
to any property or injury to any person due to neglectful, careless, unskillful, negligent, wanton, or
defective construction or installation of any building or other residential structure.

SECTION 4. Effect on Certain Causes or Causes of Action. Nothing in this code hereby
adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or
ordinance hereby repealed; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost,
impaired or affected by this ordinance.

SECTION 5. Amendments to Standard Codes. All amendments and changes hereinafter made
to the 2003 editions of the International Residential Code, International Mechanical Code,
International Fuel Gas Code, International Energy Conservation Code, International Fire Code,
International Existing Building Code, International Plumbing Code, and 2002 edition of the National
Electrical Code as well as the appendices and indices adopted therewith shall take effect within the
City of Owens Cross Roads, Alabama, on October 1 following the adoption and publication of any such
amendments and changes without any further action by the City of Owens Cross Roads with the sole
exception that any change in permit fees must be made by amendment to this Ordinance adopted by
a Resolution of the City of Owens Cross Roads. The Codes in effect at the time a permit is issued shall
govern all inspections conducted regarding that permit.



CITY OF OWENS CROSS ROADS ORDINANCE NO. 22-016

SECTION 6. Conflict of Interest. The building official and all persons employed in the office of
the building official, and their families, as the terms is defined in the Code of Alabama, § 36-25-1,
shall not solicit or receive any money or anything of value, including a gift, favor or service or promise
of future employment, from any contractor or from any person who has applied for a building permit.
A violation of this provision shall be just cause for termination.

SECTION 7. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall become effective on October 1, 2022 as adopted
by the City of Owens Cross Roads Council (the "Effective Date"). Structures existing and permitted
prior to the Effective Date, in which there is work involving additions, alterations, or changes of
occupancy shall be made to conform to the requirements of the previously adopted code. Work
permitted on the effective date and afterwards shall be made to conform to the requirements of this
code.

SECTION 8. Severability. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this code is,
for any reason, held to be invalid or unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the
remaining portions of this code. The City of Owens Cross Roads hereby declares that it would have
passed this code, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that
any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared invalid or
unconstitutional.

If any part, section or subdivision of this Ordinance shall be held unconstitutional or invalid for any
reason, such holding shall not be construed to invalidate or impair the remainder of this Ordinance, which
shall continue in full force and effect notwithstanding such holding.

EFFECTIVE DATE:

This Ordinance No. 22-016 shall become effective October 1, 2022 following adoption and
publishing/posting pursuant to Alabama law.

DONE, ORDERED, APPROVED and ADOPTED this 31¢ day of May, 2022.

Tony K. Craig, Mayor

City of Owens Cross Roads, Alabama, certificate of publication.

I, Christie D. Eason, as City Clerk of the City of Owens Cross Roads, Alabama, hereby certify that the above and foregoing copy of
1 (one) Ordinance Number 22-016 is a true and correct copy of such Ordinance that was duly adopted by the City Council of the
City of Owens Cross Roads on the 315t day of May, 2022, as same appears in the official records of said City. Said ordinance was
published by posting on the City website, and on at least five (5) bulletin boards in the City.



